
Chair: Dr Rob Caudwell 
Chief Officer: Fiona Taylor 

Our ref: FOI ID 6017 

2 December 2015 

southportandformbyccg.foi@nhs.net   

Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding NHS 
continuing healthcare funding over the last three years within NHS Southport and Formby CCG. 

Request/Response: 

I am requesting the following information relating to applications for NHS continuing healthcare 
funding over the last three years: 

1. The total number of applications for NHS continuing health care funding. If possible, how
many of these refer specifically to a mental health issue?  If this is not possible, can I just get
the overall figures?

Total Number of Applications Received 

2013-14 2014-15 2015-16 
Grand 
Total 

351 405 261 1017 

Total Number of Applications Received Related to Mental Health 

2013-14 2014-15 2015-16 
Grand 
Total 

13 5 16 34 
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2. The number of rejected applications following an assessment for NHS continuing health care
funding.  If possible, how many of these refer specifically to a mental health issue?  If this is
not possible, can I just get the overall figures?

Total Number of Applications Deemed Ineligible 

2013-14 2014-15 2015-16 
Grand 
Total 

14 38 55 107 

Total Number of Applications Deemed Ineligible Relating to Mental Health 

2013-14 2014-15 2015-16 
Grand 
Total 

1 6 6 13 

3. The number of applications subsequently accepted for NHS continuing health care funding
following an appeal.  If possible, how many of these refer specifically to a mental health
disorder?  If this is not possible, can I just get the overall figures?

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold the information whether the cases have
been awarded following an appeal.

4. A list of the top 10 largest retrospective pay-outs to individuals for NHS continuing health
care funding following a successful appeal.  If possible, how many of these refer specifically
to a mental health issue?  If this is not possible, can I just get the overall figures?

£116,384.17 £73,796.11 £52,397.87 
£49,427.32 £46,239.06 £41,374.49 
£41,307.49 £35,198.49 £29,832.67 
£26,548.73

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold the information whether it relates to a mental 
health issue. 




