Requested by Samuel Smith, samuel.smith.wll@gmail.com

Freedom of Information Request/ Answer sheet

CCG: [NHS Southport and Formby CCG

1. Please could you provide the number of adults funded by the CCG

* * *k
requiring neuro-rehabilitation during the financial year. 2013714 2014715 2015/16

Total number

*NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold the information for 2013/2014 and 2014/2015 as Specialised Commissioning
commissioned this service. You may wish to redirect your queries for questions 1 - 13 to Specialised Commissioning at NHS
England england.contactus@nhs.net

** NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to redirect questions 1 - 2 and 4 - 13 to the
Provider The Walton Centre NHS Foundation Trust www.thewaltoncentre.nhs.uk/Freedom of Information RequestForm.aspx

2. Of the total number of adults requiring neuro-rehabilitation funded by
your CCG (Q.1), how many did receive support in a Level 2a or Level 2b
rehabilitation service (as defined by the British Society of Rehabilitation 2013/14 2014/15 2015/16
Medicine: Specialised Neurorehabilitation Service Standards 7, 30th April
2015)? If number smaller than 5, please indicate with *.

Number in Level 2a rehabilitation service

Number in Level 2b rehabilitation service

3. Please provide the CCG's total expenditure on neuro-rehabilitation

placements for the financial years 2013/14, 2014/15, and 2015/16. 201314 2014/15 2015/16

Total expenditure (£) £ 615,592

4. How much of the total expenditure (Q.3) was spent with Level 2a and

Level 2b rehabilitation services? 2013714 2014715 2015/16

Total expenditure on Level 2a rehabilitation service (£)

Total expenditure on Level 2b rehabilitation service (£)

5. To how many commissioned total commissioned bed days did the
expenditure (Q.4) on Level 2a and Level 2b rehabilitation services 2013/14 2014/15 2015/16
correlate?

Total number of bed days commissioned on Level 2a (Days)

Total number of bed days commissioned on Level 2b (Days)

6. Please provide a list of the providers that you commissioned neuro-
rehabilitation Level 2a and Level 2b services with.

7. Please could you provide the number of adults funded by the CCG

requiring neuro-rehabilitation in a Level 3 rehabilitation service. 2013714 2014715 2015/16

Total number

8. Please provide the CCG's total expenditudre on Level 3 neuro-

rehabilitation placements (as per Q.7) during the financial year. 2013714 2014715 2015/16

Total expenditure (£)

9. Please could you provide the number of adults funded by the CCG

s S K . 2013/14 2014/15 2015/16
requiring neuro-palliative care in a nursing/care home.

Total number

10. Please provide the CCG's total expenditudre on neuro-palliative

placements (as per Q.9) during the financial year. 2013714 2014715 2015/16

Total expenditure (£)

11. Please provide a list of the providers that you commissioned the neuro-
rehabilitation Level 3 services with.

12. Please provide a list of the providers that you commissioned the neuro-
palliative services with.

13. How many individuals as per Q.1 where on placements outside the

boundaries of your CCG (i.e. out of area placement)? 2013714 2014715 2015/16




Number of individuals out of area|




