

Our Ref: 53423

30 November 2018

southportandformbyccq.foi@nhs.net

NHS Southport & Formby CCG 5 Curzon Road Southport PR8 6PL

Tel: 0151 317 8456

Email: southportandformby.ccg@nhs.net

Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding Adult Eating Disorder services within NHS Southport and Formby CCG.

Request/Response:

1. Do you commission an Adult Eating Disorder service?

Yes – Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust (community service delivering psychological assessment and intervention).

2. Is this a separate service or part of an all age model of service?

Separate

3. Can you identify the population area covered?

Southport and Formby

4. What is the population?

125,302

5. How many staff are within the Adult Eating Disorder service?

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to refer your query to-

Mersey Care NHS Trust

freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

6. Can you breakdown the staffing level by skill mix? i.e 2 Consultant Psychiatrists 1 Band 8c Psychologists

NHS Southport and Formby CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to refer your query to-

Mersey Care NHS Trust

freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk